
greenius License Conditions: 

The software tool greenius (“Software”) is provided by Deutsches Zentrum für Luft- und Raumfahrt 
e.V. (“DLR”) in object code to anyone and may be used for any purpose whatsoever.   

You have the non-exclusive right to use the program free of charge. The Software and the 
documentation is provided "as is" without a warranty of any kind. The data and algorithms provided 
with this Software may contain errors or produce incorrect results. This Software is based on 
theoretical models, which may not reproduce real conditions totally. As a result, practical results may 
differ significantly from the simulation results of this Software. The entire risk for the quality and 
performance of the Software, data and calculation is borne by you. 

This Software was successfully tested with the most common Microsoft® Windows operation systems. 
However, installing and running new software may produce some difficulties and data losses. 
Therefore, it is strictly recommended to make a backup of all data and software of your PC before 
starting the installation.  

There is no warranty for correct information or the non-existence of subsequent damage of any kind. It 
is NOT warranted that the functions contained in the software will meet your requirements or that the 
operation of the Software will be uninterrupted or error free. 

You agree that you will not, and will not allow any third party to, (1) sell, license, distribute, transfer, 
modify, adapt, translate, prepare derivative works from, decompile, reverse engineer, disassemble or 
otherwise attempt to derive source code from the Software, unless otherwise permitted, (2) take any 
action to circumvent or defeat the security or content usage rules provided, deployed or enforced by 
any functionality contained in the Software.  

You may terminate this license at any time by destroying all copies of the Software. This license may 
be also terminated if you do not comply with or violate the terms and conditions of this License 
Agreement. Upon such termination, you agree to destroy or return all your copies of the Software. 

In no event DLR shall be liable for any loss or damage, weather direct, consequential or indirect, 
howsoever arising and of whatsoever nature suffered or incurred by the licensee including without 
limitation loss of profits, loss of contracts, loss of data, loss of operation time or loss of use of any 
equipment or process suffered indirectly by the license and loss of anticipated savings. 

This license and the use of the software does not relieve Licensee from carrying out own tests and 
calculations. 

The names DLR shall not be used in any representation, advertising, publicity or other manner 
whatsoever to endorse or promote any entity that adopts or uses the Software. DLR shall not provide 
any support, consulting, training or assistance of any kind with regard to the use of Greenius or any 
updates, revisions or new versions of the Software. 

 

YOU AGREE TO INDEMNIFY DLR AND ITS EMPLOYEES AGAINST ANY CLAIM OR DEMAND, 
INCLUDING REASONABLE ATTORNEYS' FEES, RELATED TO YOUR USE, RELIANCE, OR 
ADOPTION OF GREENIUS FOR ANY PURPOSE WHATSOEVER.  GREENIUS IS PROVIDED BY 
DLR "AS IS" AND ANY EXPRESS OR IMPLIED WARRANTIES, INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO 
THE IMPLIED WARRANTIES OF MERCHANTABILITY AND FITNESS FOR A PARTICULAR 
PURPOSE OR NON-INFRINGEMENT OF THIRD PARTY RIGHTS ARE EXPRESSLY DISCLAIMED. 
IN NO EVENT SHALL DLR BE LIABLE FOR ANY SPECIAL, INDIRECT OR CONSEQUENTIAL 
DAMAGES OR ANY DAMAGES WHATSOEVER, INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO CLAIMS 
ASSOCIATED WITH THE LOSS OF DATA OR PROFITS, WHICH MAY RESULT FROM ANY 
ACTION IN CONTRACT, NEGLIGENCE OR OTHER TORTIOUS CLAIM THAT ARISES OUT OF OR 
IN CONNECTION WITH THE USE OR PERFORMANCE OF GREENIUS. 

 

 


